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January 3, 1935
To my dear friends Rose Freeman Ishill and Joseph Ishill:
Great and glorious was my surprise at receiving yesterday

the three beautiful booklets, for which you have my heartfelt
thanks.
Cunninghame Graham has long been an object of my espe-

cial admiration, though I have not the honor of his acquain-
tance. But a notable occasion marks my memory of [William]
Morris. In his home at Hammersmith, in 1889, I sat one Sunday
evening at a midnight supper. Morris himself was alone, at the
head of the table. At his right sat Belfort Bax, whom thirty-five
years later I knew intimately at Nice. I sat at Bax’s right, and at
my right sat May Morris. Opposite her sat her lover, Sparling,
and at his right, opposite Bax and myself, was Bernard Shaw,
whom I had met for the first time two or three days earlier.
At that time Morris had not begun to take an interest in fine
printing, but that interest was perhaps precipitated by a little
object I took frommy pocket, feeling that it would disgust Mor-
ris at the same time as it had already disgusted, but at the same
time interested, me. It was a thin strip of metal bearing on its
edge, as part of itself, my name in the letters of typography. I



said that it was made for me the previous morning, in my pres-
ence and almost at a flash, by a singular machine then being
exhibited in a small room in London, by Stilson Hutchins, an
American journalist and capitalist, who was trying to interest
English capitalists. I declared my belief that the problem of me-
chanical typography was solved, at the same time expressing
my disgust. I love to believe that this incident helped to induce
Morris to champion the cause of artistic printing, and I am cer-
tain that it will be appreciated by yourselves. For my part, I
hate the linotype.
You will see from the foregoing that I have more reasons

than one for appreciating your beautiful gift. Most heartily I
thank you.
Benjamin R. Tucker
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